
Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter

Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter

Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter

Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter

Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter

Very elegant and refined, a modern 
style that fully preserves the soul of 
the Douro’s native grape varieties. 
Aroma that harmoniously blends the 
concentration of Douro reds in all their 
complexity. Berries, hints of rock rose, 
spices, exuberant violets and extremely 
fresh notes of basil and bergamot.

CASTELLO 
D’ALBA
VINHAS VELHAS

95 
Points
Decanter


